Republic of the Philippines
Department of Health
CENTRAL OFFICE BIDS AND AWARDSCOMMITTEE

COBAC RESOLUTION NO. 2019-385-A
09 October 2019

RECOMMENDING APPROVAL FOR THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR ITEM NO. 1 FOR THE
PROCUREMENT OF MOTOR VEHICLES
IB NO. 2019-248

WHEREAS, Competitive Bidding for the Procurement of Motor Vehicles was conducted in accordance with Republic Act
(RA) 9184 and its 2016 Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations (IRR) through the Trust Receipts representing
Donation from the Republic of China with a Total Approved Budget for the Contract (ABC) of Seven Million Four Hundred
Forty Eight Thousand Three Hundred Fifty Philippine Pesos (Php7.448,350.00), to wit:

1 N Description Total ABC (PhP)
1 Light Cargo Truck 2,859,850.00
2 4x4 Pick-up Emergency Response Vehicle 2 unit 2,788,500.00
3 Light Delivery Van 1 unit 1.800,000.00
TOTAL 7,448,350.00

WHEREAS, Purchase Requests (PRs) for Items No. 1 and 2 were received from Health Emergency Management Bureau
(HEMB);

WHEREAS, on 21 May 2019, a Mandatory Review and Pre-procurement Conference for Item No. 1 was conducted at 2:00
PM at the COBAC Conference Room, Department of Health (DOH), to discuss the revision to be made and to await the
result of evaluation for Item No. 2 for possible consolidation of both items in a single project;

WHEREAS, on 25 June 2019, Purchase Request (PR) for Item No. 3 was received from Health Emergency Management
Bureau (HEMB);

WHEREAS, on 02 July 2019, the PR was presented to COBAC-D during its 27" Regular Meeting. Upon deliberation, the
COBAC-D instructed the Secretariat to conduct Pre-procurement Conference;

WHEREAS, on 09 July 2019, a Mandatory Review and Pre-procurement Conference for Items No. 2 and 3 was conducted at
10:00 AM at the COBAC Conference Room, DOH and the COBAC-D decided to consolidate the three (3) items into one
procurement project and proceed with the procurement process;

WHEREAS, on 22 July 2019, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was posted in the PhilGEPS website and in conspicuous places
within the premises of the DOH for a continuous period of seven (7) calendar days;

WHEREAS, the Technical Working Group (TWG) was created through the issuance of the Department Personnel Order
(DPO) COBAC No. 2019-261 dated 23 July 2019;

WHERIEAS, on 30 July 2019, the Pre-bidding Conference took place as scheduled at 10:00 AM at COBAC Conference
Room, DOH, Manila, with four (4) prospective bidders participating, namely:

Hyudai Alabang Inc (HAI);

Matterhorn Motor Inc / Ford Manila Bay (MMI/FMB);
Hino UN-Ave Manila (HUAM); and

Nissan Bataan (NB)

el ol

WHEREAS, on 02 August 2019, the Minutes of the Pre-bidding Conference was posted in the DOH website;

RECOMMENDING APPROVAL FOR THE AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR ITEM NO. 1 FOR THE PROCUREMENT OF MOTOR
VEHICLES
1B NO. 2019-248




Activity From To Venue
Submission and 13 August 2019; 20 August 2019; COBAC Conference Room, G/F, Bldg. 6,
Opening of Bids 09:00 A.M. 09:00 A.M. Department of Health, San Lazaro
Compound, Rizal Avenue, Sta. Cruz, Manila

WHEREAS, on 20 August 2019, the Submission and Opening of Bids took place as re-scheduled at 9:00 A.M. at the
COBAC Conference Room, Ground Floor, Bldg. 6, DOH,;

WHEREAS, three (3) prospective bidders, purchased the bidding document and subsequently submitted their respective
proposals, namely:

1. HAI
2. MMI/FMB; and
3. One Alliance Motor Source Inc. (OAMSI)

WHEREAS, the first envelopes, containing the Eligibility and Technical Documents were individually opened and the
presence, completeness and correctness of the documents were verified by the COBAC-D in the presence of the prospective
bidders’ representative and upon examination, the three (3) bidders were declared “ELIGIBLE”;

WHEREAS, the second envelopes, containing the Financial Proposals were individually opened and the presence,
completeness and correctness of the Financial Documents were verified by the COBAC-D and upon examination, the three

(3) “ELIGIBLE” bidders were rated “PASSED” and their respective proposals were read out publicly and posted in the
Abstract of Bids, to wit:

1 2 3
Name of Company MMI/FMB _ HAI OAMSI
Bid Security BID SECURING BID SECURING BID SECURING
DECLARATION DECLARATION DECLARATION
Amount N/A N/A N/A
Validity N/A N/A N/A
* ELIGIBLE AND ELIGIBLE AN ELIGIBLE AND
RENARISE PASSED PASSED PASSED
Item No. Item Description Qty Unit | TOTAL ABC BID PRICE AS READ (PhP)
Light Cargo Truck 1 unit 2,859,850.00 NO BID NO BID 2,499.000.00
4x4 Pick-up
Emergency Response 2 unit 2,788,500.00 2,599,720.00 NO BID NO BID
Vehicle
Light Delivery Van 1 unit 1,800,000.00 NO BID 1,740,000.00 NO BID

WHEREAS, OAMSI was declared to be the lone bidder for Item No. 1, MMI/FMB for Item No. 2, and HAI for Item No. 3,
subject to further arithmetical review and correction of the financial bid, if necessary;

WHEREAS, on 22 August 2019, the evaluation and bid ranking of the financial proposal of OAMSI was undertaken by the
designated TWG- Financial Evaluator;

WHEREAS, the bid for each item listed below was found to be substantially complying:

Item No. 1 — One (1) unit Light Cargo Truck

Bidder Particular ABC (PHP) Bid as Calculated % Variance from
Rank Amount (PhP) ABC
1 OAMSI 2,859,850.00 2,499,000.00 12.61%

Item No. 2 — Two (2) units 4x4 Pick-up Emergency Response Vehicle

Bidder No. Particular ABC (PHP) Bid as Calculated % Variance from
Amount (PhP) ABC
1 MMI/FMB 2,788,500.00 2,599,720.00 6.76%
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Item No. 3 — One (1) unit Light Delivery Van

Bidder No. Particular ABC (PHP) Bid as Calculated % Variance from
Amount (PhP) ABC
1 HAI 1,800,000.00 1,740,000.00 3.33%

WHEREAS, the COBAC Resolution No. 2019-385 “Recommending Approval for the Award of Contract for Item No. 2 for
the Procurement of Motor Vehicles” was approved;

WHEREAS, on the same date, the detailed evaluation on the submitted Technical and Legal aspects of the documents of the
was SCB undertaken by the TWG — Technical and Legal Evaluators;

WHEREAS, on 23 August 2019, TWG-Financial Evaluator ranked OAMSI as the SCB for Item No. 1, found its bid
“complying” and submitted its report;

WHEREAS, on 27 August 2019, the Abstract of Bid as Calculated was presented to the COBAC-D during its 34™ Regular
Meeting and concurred with the TWG Report and decided to proceed with the post-qualification upon receipt of the
additional post-qualification requirements;

WHEREAS, on 03 September 2019, the COBAC-D issued a letter through electronic mail (e-mail) to OAMSI requesting for
the submission of the Post-qualification requirements within a non-extendible period of five (5) calendar days upon receipt of
the notification;

WHEREAS, on 09 September 2019, OAMSI submitted its Post-Qualification requirements within the prescribed period;

WHEREAS, on the same date, the Post-qualification requirements of OAMSI was undertaken by the TWG;

WHEREAS, the TWG found OAMSI “Responsive” and submitted its report;
WHEREAS, on 10 September 2019, the TWG submitted the Bid Evaluation and Post-Qualification Evaluation Reports was
presented to the COBAC-D during its 36" Regular Meeting, found that the seat cover was not included in the offered Set of

Standard Tools and Aecessories. Upon review and deliberation the Committee decided to-issue letter to clarify the finding;

WHEREAS, on 18 September 2019, a letter was issued to OAMSI through email requesting to clarify the above-cited TWG
finding;

WHEREAS, on 19 September 2019, the COBAC-D received a response letter from OAMSI clarifying the finding;

WHEREAS, on 20 September 2019, the request for extension of Post-qualification Evaluation was issued by the COBAC-D
for approval of the HoPE or its duly signed authorized signatory;

WHEREAS, the request for Extension of Post-qualification was approved on the same date;
WHEREAS, on 23 September 2019, the COBAC-D issued a letter acknowledging the receipt of the said letter to OAMSI;
WHEREAS, on the same date, cited letter was forwarded to the End-user for further evaluation;

WHEREAS, on 25 September 2019, a memorandum was received from HEMB informing that the clarification letter from
OAMSI was found valid and acceptable;

WHEREAS, on 01 October, the cited memorandum was presented to the COBAC-D during its 38" Regular Meeting and upon
review, declared OAMSI “Responsive”;

WHEREAS, on 03 October 2019, the TWG submitted the Bid Evaluation and Post-Qualification Evaluation Reports citing
OAMSI “Responsive” to all the requirements and conditions specified in the bidding documents;

WHEREAS, 08 October 2019, the COBAC-D reviewed and deliberated the TWG report as well as the documents submitted
_by the SCB and the following are the salient points of discussion:

Description Name of Bidder’s | Total ABC Bid Price TWG COBAC
Bidder Rank (PhP) (PhP) Finding Recommendation Finding Recommendation
Item No. 1: One SCB 2,859,850.00 | 2499,000.00 | The SCB Responsive = COBAC  conforms | Single Calculated
Light Cargo | Alliance passed the post with the | and Responsive
Truck Motor qualification recommendation  of
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Source, and found to the TWG.

Inc. have complied e OAMSI is determined
with the legal, to be responsive and
technical  and post-qualified and
financial recommended for the
requirements, award of contract.

WHEREAS, at the time of the signing of this resolution, there is no pending incident, no pending Request for
Reconsideration, no pending Protest and the COBAC-D followed the requirements set forth in R.A. 9184;

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the above premises, the herein members of the COBAC-D HEREBY RESOLVE
the following:

1. Recommend the award of contract to One Alliance Motor Source, Inc. with a Total Contract Price of Two Million
Four Hundred Ninety Nine Thousand Philippine Pesos (PhP2,499,000.00) inclusive of other taxes for the item listed
below:

Qt Total Bid Price (PhP)
1 unit 2,499,000.00

o

Light Cargo Truck

2. Issue another resolution for the Item listed below, upon receipt of the TWG Evaluation Report and deliberation of the
COBAC-D:

In otal ABC (PhP
1 unit 1,800,000.00

Light Delivery Van

NV

Signed this dayof " 2019 at the Department of Health, San Lazaro Compound, Sta. Cruz, Manila.

CENTRAL OFFICE BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE-D

MELISSA T. SENA, MD, MPH
Regular Member 1oy

FRANKLIN C. DIZA, MD, MPH ENRIQ ST » MD, PHSAE, FPSMID, CESO II1
Alternate Member k ice-Chairperson

LILIBETH C. DAVID, MD, MPH, MPM, CESO I

Undersecretary of Health
Chairperson
By Authority of the Secretary of Health:
GLORIA J. BALBOA, MD, MPH, CEO VI, CESO III

Director IV o
Health Emergency Management Burean |t /
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